10/8/2021 Fwd: Fw: SJA for Recheck/Solve pending queries (SJA_685_17R5) - antoniusdimas29394@gmail.com - Gmail

—--—-—— Forwarded message -—-—-

Dari: Sirait RH <sirait.rh@gmail.com>

Date: Sab, 17 Feb 2018 pukul 10.27

Subject: Fwd: Fw: SJA for Recheck/Solve pending queries (SJA_685_17R5)
To: <m_ramli_ahmad@yahoo.co.id>

Siang Prof, berikut naskah tulisan saya yang mau di publis Saudi Journal of Anaesthesia (Q2).
Terimakasih banyak Prof untuk semua bantuannya.

Forwarded message -—--—--

From: Mochammad Hatta <hattaram@yahoo.com>

Date: 2018-02-06 12:38 GMT+07:00

Subject: Fw: SJA for Recheck/Solve pending queries (SJA_685_17R5)

To: Sirait RH <sirait.rh@gmail.com>

Selamat pagi Robert

Tolng lihat kembali apakah masih ada yg perlu diperbaiki dan infokan ini hari karena sudah akan dipublish
Selamat

Salam

Prof Hatta

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

On Tuesday, February 6, 2018, 1:24 PM, Shaikh, Mubeen <Mubeen.Shaikh@wolterskluwer.com> wrote:

Dear Author,

Greetings!

Could you please check the updated article on priority basis.

I'd appreciate if you could send it as soon as possible to avoid delay in SUA_Jul_Sep_18 issue publication.

Regards,

Mubeen Shaikh

Production Editor

Health Learning, Research & Practice

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/#search/sirait.rh%40gmail.com/FMfcgzGkZZqZHcrHBrvLPdVIqJKvz TTj



10/8/2021 Fwd: Fw: Author Proofing - antoniusdimas29394@gmail.com - Gmail

— Forwarded message ———-

Dari: Sirait RH <sirait.-h@gmail.com>
Date: Jum, 23 Feb 2018 pukul 13.39
Subject: Fwd: Fw: Author Proofing

To: <y 1gsuprayQgi@rocketmail com>

B Pesan terusan e

Tanggal. 20 Feb 2018 9.36 AM

Subjek: Fwd: Fw: Author Proofing

Kepada: "Abdul Muin Tanribali" <mumufkuh@gmail.com>
Cc:

Pesan terusan -—----—

Dari: "Mochammad Hatta" <hattaram@yahoco.com>
Tanggal: 19 Feb 2018 6:01 PM

Subjek: Fw: Author Proofing

Kepada: "Sirait RH" <sirait.rh@gmail.com>, "Tigor P. Simanjuntak” <tigorpsimanjuntak@gmail.com>

Cc:

Selamat sore Robert n Tigor

Tolong diisi dan ditandatangani oleh masing author

Besok rencana saya akan kirim ulang untuk segera dipublished
Selamat Robert

Tks

Salam

Prof Hatta

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

On Monday, February 19, 2018, 5:53 PM, EManuscript Services <galleys@emanuscript.in> wrote:

Dear Author,

Please find the Galley Proof for your manuscript to be published in forthcoming issue of “Pharmacognosy Journal” scheduled to launch soon. The galley proof is attached to this en

X:

further processed for web publication. Hence, thorough checking is expected from your side during this galley proofing.

Kindly submit the corrections within 48 hours.

Please note that the copyright form signed by all authors is mandatory for the publication in Pharmacognosy Journal.

Thanks & Regards,

MD SALMAN

Administrative Office

EManuscript (Publishing)

[A publishing division of Phcog.Net]
#17, Il Floor, Buddha Vihar Road
Cox Town, Bangalore 560 046, INDIA

3 Lampiran

copyright_form_...

- comments_form_...

[ PJ_250_17.pdf ]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/Of#search/sirait.rh%40gmail.com/FMfcgzGkZZqZHcqfgBXNSIUMdzxrDLSD

et.adobe com/reader/ or as scanned image files in JPG format along with the comments from within 2 Days. Please reply this email at priority. Please note, we may not bt
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10/8/2021 Fwd: FPA Invoice payment proof - antoniusdimas29394@gmail.com - Gmail

— Forwarded message
Dari: Mochammad Hatta <hattaram@yahoo.com>

Date: Sab, 24 Feb 2018 pukul 19.59

Subject: Re: FPA Invoice payment proof

To: EManuscript Services <services@emanuscript.in>

Cc: EManuscript Services <galleys@emanuscript.in>, Sirait RH <sirait.rh@gmail.com>

Dear Sir

Thank you for your email concerning with FPA payment of manuscript no PJ_250_17 for published in Pharmacognosy Journal.
We very appreciate if you could inform us about the volume and issue should be published its.

| am looking forward to hear from you

Thank you for your kind cooperation

Best wishes

Prof Mochammad Hatta

Correspondence author

Sent from my iPhone

On 23 Feb 2018, at 17.55, EManuscript Services <services@emanuscript.in> wrote:

Dear Author,

We acknowledge the receipt of your payment.
Regards

2018-02-14 10:27 GMT+05:30 EManuscript Services <services@emanuscript.in>:
Dear Author,

Thanks for the payment details, will acknowledge it shortly.
regards

2018-02-14 2:17 GMT+05:30 Mochammad Hatta <hattaram@yahoo.com>:
Dear Mr Yunus
Please find the attachment file of FPA payment proof for published our manuscript no PJ_250_17 in Pharmacognosy Journal
We looking forward to hear from you in soon
Thank you for your kind cooperation
Best wishes
Prof Mochammad Hatta
Correspondence author

Pesan asli
Dari: service@intl.paypal.com

Tanggal: 13/02/18 22:26 (GMT+07:00)
Ke: Robert Sirait <sirait.rh@gmail.com>
Subjek: Anda telah mengirim pembayaran

Yth. Robert Sirait,

Anda telah
mengirim $200,00 USDkepada EMANUSCRIPT
TECHNOLOGIES.

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/O/#search/sirait.rh%40gmail.com/FMfcgzGkZZqZHcgfWNnpVIHHGTVJHZTp 1/2



