
From: editor@scienceijsar.com
Subject: Re: Article Proof: IJSAR-1385
Date: 30 January 2023 14.44
To: Angel Damayanti angel.damayanti@uki.ac.id

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thanks for your email. We have received your article correction. Shortly we will publish
your article.

On 2023-01-27 04:07, Angel Damayanti wrote:

Dear Editor, 

 Please find attached the revision of our article No. IJSAR 1385 in
word and pdf formats. I have revised directly to the article as
written in the document. 

 Thank you, and we look forward to the publication. 

 Regards, 

Angel Damayanti, Ph.D  
Associate Professor - International Relations Study Program 
Faculty of Social and Political Sciences 
Universitas Kristen Indonesia

Jl. Mayjen Sutoyo No. 2 Cawang,  
Jakarta Timur 
Ph. No. (021) 8092425 

-------------------------

From: editor@scienceijsar.com <editor@scienceijsar.com>
Sent: Friday, January 27, 2023 3:15 PM
To: Angel Damayanti <angel.damayanti@uki.ac.id>
Subject: Article Proof: IJSAR-1385 

Send your article corrections within two days 

Method of returning proof corrections: 

You may list the corrections in an e-mail and return them to us using
the ‘reply’ button to this e-mail. Please list your corrections
quoting line/page number. 

If, for any reason, this is not possible, mark the corrections and any
other comments on a printout of your proof and scan and attach using
the ‘reply’ button to this e-mail. 

Please use this proof for checking the typesetting, editing,
completeness and correctness of the text, tables and figures.
Significant changes to the article as accepted for publication will
only be considered at this stage with permission from the Editor. We
prefer to receive your corrections by e-mail so that we can process
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your article quickly and efficiently. We will do everything possible
to get your article published quickly and accurately.  Therefore, it
is important to ensure that all of your corrections are sent back to
us in one communication within 12 hours of receipt: please check
carefully before replying, as inclusion of any subsequent corrections
cannot be guaranteed. 

With regards 

Editorial Office  

IJSAR 

Email: editor@scienceijsar.com
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From: SCIENTIFIC JOURNAL science.ijsar2020@gmail.com
Subject: Re: Challenges in dealing with oil spill in the Indian Ocean

Date: 25 January 2023 19.40
To: Angel Damayanti angel.damayanti@uki.ac.id

PAYMENT CONFIRMATION

Dear sir or madam
 
Greetings!
 
We are happy to inform you that we have received the
article processing fees. Shortly I will send proof of the
article. Please send the scanned copy of the copyright form
immediately.  I will publish your article in the coming
issue.
 
Please note, as per the instructions for authors, all
manuscripts must be accompanied by a signed copyright
form to progress through to the final stage of production.
You are requested to send the copyright transfer agreement
form within 3 working days after receiving this mail so that
we can proceed with the publication. Copyright form
downloads to our journal website (www.scienceijsar.com).
Please print and sign the attached copyright form and send
the scanned copy to the email address  
editor@scienceijsar.com
 
Finances Section
International Journal of Science Academic Research
www.scienceijsar.com
On Wed, Jan 25, 2023, 18:05 Angel Damayanti <angel.damayanti@uki.ac.id> wrote:

Dear Editor-in-Chief,

Thank you for your positive confirmation regarding our article, No IJSAR-1385,
titled Challenges in Dealing with Oil Spill in the Indian Ocean: Case Study of
Mauritius Waters. We appreciate it. 

Please find attached the proof of the payment through PayPal.

We look forward to the publication. Thank you.
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Regards,

Angel Damayanti, Ph.D 
Associate Professor - International Relations Study Program
Faculty of Social and Political Sciences
Universitas Kristen Indonesia
Jl. Mayjen Sutoyo No. 2 Cawang, 
Jakarta Timur
Ph. No. (021) 8092425

From: SCIENTIFIC JOURNAL <science.ijsar2020@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, January 24, 2023 10:13 PM
To: Angel Damayanti <angel.damayanti@uki.ac.id>
Subject: Challenges in dealing with oil spill in the Indian Ocean
 

INTERNATIONAL JOURNAL OF SCIENCE ACADEMIC RESEARCH
www.scienceijsar.com

 
Dear Sir/Madam
               
The Editor-in-Chief is pleased to inform you that, your article Accepted for the
Publication of International Journal of Science Academic Research (ISSN: 2582-
6425). You are requested to please send (75USD) towards the cost of processing fees
immediately. Soon after getting the amount credited after that we will send your article
proof copy to your corresponding author email id.
 
Articles Status: Accepted
 
Publication fees: 75USD

 
Papers Details
 

Manuscript
Number Article Title

IJSAR-1385
Challenges in dealing with oil spill in the Indian Ocean:  Case study of
Mauritius waters

 
PLEASE SEND YOUR PROCESSING FEES TO
 
PayPal  Money Transfer
 

Email IdEmail Id : science.ijsar2020@gmail.com
AddressAddress : 23/14, Old Cuddalore Main Road, Thiruvathigai, Panruti (TK),

Cuddalore – 607106, Tamilnadu, India.
 
Western Union Money Transfer
Receiver name Receiver name 
AddressAddress

: Gnanasekar Sankar
: 19/42, Avai new street, Panruti, Cuddalore, Tamilnadu-607106,
India
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India
 

Money Gram Money Transfer (Or) Express Money (Or) UAE Exchange Money
Transfer
Receiver name Receiver name 
AddressAddress

: Gnanasekar Sankar
: 19/42, Avai new street, Panruti, Cuddalore, Tamilnadu-607106,
India

 
Kindly make the payment via transfer and send a scanned copy of the Bank transfer
payment slip for confirmation and documentation of your publication fee payment.
 
If you have any queries regarding this invoice, send email to:
finance.ijsar@gmail.com
 
Thank you for your contribution to the International Journal of Science Academic
Research and we look forward to receiving further submissions from you.

 
 

REPLY IMMEDIATELY
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